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Exhibit A - Schedule of Bid Prices

RFQ# OPD 210278 Janitorial Services for OPD

Bright Corners Serviamgos Advanced Godfrey Kings Blue Ribbon Envirosanitize

Item Building Name Cleaning Frequency Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual Monthly Annual

1 SOPZDSM;':EB:V":;E (Headquarters) o day_Fi d‘gssg%r:’r?k_ 300 pm) § 1690.00| $ 20280.00[ $ 210000 | $ 2520000 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 20,400.00 $ - | s437878 | ¢ 5254536 $7371.00 | $ 8845200 | $ 2482800 | § 297,936.00
OPD West District 3 days per week
2 625 NW MLK Ave (Monday, Wednesday,yFriZay 800 am. to 9:30 a.m) $ 385.00| $ 4,62000] $ 42000 | $ 504000 $ 60000 $ 7,200.00 $ - $ 37508 |$ 450096 $ 737.10( $ 884520 $ 1,736.00| $§ 20,832.00
3 SOPSDNE:S;tE ';”Ct (Monday, We dnesZ:;y;rizz;mé:eOe(I)(a,m wo0am | § 38500 § 462000]§  42000| $ 504000 $ 60000 $ 720000 $ - |s 37653|$ 451836|$ 73710|$  884520| ¢ 163600|% 1963200
4 :Z)EZTW outh €T (Tuesday and Tijrasfaszrovéeael:n 930 arm) $  39000| $ 468000 ¢ 28000|$ 336000|$ 50000 $ 600000 $ - |s 26160[$ 313920|¢ 49140|$ 589680|¢ 1,20100($ 1441200
Total Base Quote Amount: $ 43,144.14 352,812.00
Optional Line Items (items 5-11): Pricing must be provided for the items below, however, these items will not be considered in determination of award.
Exterior Window Cleaning

Item Building Name Price per Occurrence
5 OPD Main Building (Headquarters) $6.00 per window no bid $ 3,000.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 108.00] $ 795.00] $ 4,655.00
6 OPD West District $6.00 per window no bid $ 1,200.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 4000 $ 195.00 | $ 1,250.00
7 OPD East District $6.00 per window no bid $ 1,200.00 | $ 100.00| $ 40001 $ 195.00 | $ 1,345.00
8 UDEST $6.00 per window no bid $ 1,400.00 | $ 100.00| $ 20.00| $ 100.00 | $ 1,125.00

Floor Maintenance

Item Type of Floor/Maintenance Price per Square Foot
9 VCT - Stripping and waxing/buffing 0.35 sq ft no bid $ 055] $ 032]5$ 035] $ 045] $ 0.85
10 Tile Ceramic - Deep cleaning 0.25 sq ft no bid $ 0451 $ 032]1% 0211 % 0401 % 1.25

Emergency Cleaning Services

Item Emergency Cleaning- Any Building Price per Hour

11 Cost per hour for emergency cleaning services at any location covered under this solicitation | $ 22501 % 25001 $ 25001 ¢ 225001 % 20701 $ 25001 $ 38.79




	Sheet1

